
Anterior sacral meningocoele is caused by a congeni-
tal hiatus in the anterior sacrum. We report a very
rare case which presented as acute urinary retention.
The common findings of anterior sacral meningocele
include atypical low back pain, urological and
 gynaecological symptoms. Acute urinary retention as
a presenting symptom does not appear to have been
mentioned in the English literature.
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INTRODUCTION

Anterior sacral meningocoele (ASM) was first
described in 1837. The entity consists of a congen-
ital hiatus in the anterior sacrum, through which the
meninges (dura and arachnoidea mater) gradually
herniate. This movement is thought to be driven
by cerebrospinal fluid pulsations (1). The onset of
symptoms is usually in early adult life, when the
mass has grown large enough to exert pressure on
nearby organs, such as the bladder, rectum and
uterus. Usually symptoms (orthopaedic, gynaeco-
logical, abdominal, urological or neurological)
appear gradually and are chronic in nature. To our
knowledge, this is the first case report in the english
literature where an ASM presents as an acute uri-
nary retention in a seemingly healthy young male
adult.

CASE REPORT

A 22-year-old male patient presented to our
emergency department with lower abdominal pain.
He had been unable to pass urine since the night
before. Physical examination revealed a large
suprapubic mass. Its estimated volume on echo-
graphic investigation was more than one liter. This
acute urinary retention was treated by way of
transurethral catheterisation, after which the patient
was discharged from the hospital. Further follow-up
was planned on an ambulatory basis. Urological
evaluation consisted of urinary flow measurement.
The maximum flow rate was far lower than expect-
ed in a patient of his age. We found a large volume
on postmictional echographic evaluation of the
bladder, along with a thickened bladder wall. The
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patient was then referred for a computerized tomo-
graphic (CT) scan of the abdomen and pelvis
(fig 1). The CT image showed a large pelvic mass
(largest diameter of 17 cm), in direct communica-
tion with the spinal canal through a defect in the
anterior sacrum. Bladder and rectum, both pushed
aside by the mass, appeared normal. Magnetic
Resonance Imaging (MRI) of the same region was
compatible with an anterior sacral meningocoele.
Definitive treatment consisted of closure of the
meningocoele sac and the sacral defect by a muscle
flap. Despite this surgical attempt a recurrence of
the cystic structure was noted, along with bladder
compression. A symptomatic relief was finally pro-
vided with the insertion of a peritoneal shunt. 

DISCUSSION

No more than about 200 cases of ASM have been
reported since it was first described in 1837. The
entity consists of a congenital hiatus in the anterior
sacrum, through which the meninges (dura and
arachnoidea) gradually herniate. This movement is
thought to be driven by cerebrospinal fluid pulsa-
tions (1). The onset of symptoms is usually in early
adult life, when the mass has grown large enough to
exert pressure on nearby organs, such as the blad-
der, rectum and uterus. In our patient, the pressure
on the bladder neck had risen to such a level as to
make voiding impossible. Other presenting symp-
toms reported in previous cases included back pain,
acute meningitis (6), chronic constipation (4), recur-
rent headaches and obstetrical problems (5). Other
urologic symptoms may include urinary inconti-
nence or urgency. Upon clinical gynaecological
examination of female patients, the meningocoele
can be mistaken for an ovarian cyst (2). ASM is
sometimes part of a hereditary syndrome called the
Currarino triad. This combination of a presacral
mass, anorectal malformation and hemisacrum was
described by Currarino et al in 1981 (3). It may also
be related to Marfan’s syndrome (7). Careful analy-
sis of the paediatric medical files of the patient
revealed a tendency to anal atresia in the postnatal
period, for which dilations were performed. We
could therefore consider this a Currarino syndrome,
although there were presently no signs of perma-
nent anorectal malformation. To our knowledge,
this is the first case report in the English literature
where an ASM presents as acute urinary retention
in a seemingly healthy young male adult. It shows
the importance of thorough further investigation in
young patients presenting with these symptoms.
Our patient might have developed an acute menin-
gitis, had a suprapubic punction been performed as
treatment of the urinary retention in the emergency
setting. 
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Fig. 1.— CT-scan of the abdomen and pelvis, showing a large
pelvic mass (M) in direct communication with the spinal canal
through a defect in the anterior sacrum (arrow). The bladder
(B) is pushed anteriorly.
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